
Annexure-I

Indian Institute of Corporate Affairs- Synopsis

Indian Institute of Corporate Affairs(IICA) has been established by 
the  Ministry  of  Corporate  Affairs  as  a  think-tank,  capacity  building  and 
service delivery Institute to help corporate growth, reforms and regulation. 

IICA has been registered as a Society under the Societies Registration 
Act 1860 on 12.09.2008.  The Board of Governors has 17 Members, 14 of 
whom  are  from  amongst  eminent  companies,  professionals,  heads  of 
institutions and experts. At present the Institute is operating from Paryavaran 
Bhawan,  CGO  Complex,  Lodhi  Road,  New Delhi.   The  campus  of  the 
Institute is being constructed at Manesar, and is nearing completion.

The institute is providing support to the Ministry in review/revision of 
existing corporate laws, rule and regulations, as well as in framing of new 
ones, as per requirements of a dynamic economic environment. In addition, 
it  is  providing training to Indian Company Law Service(ICLS) and other 
officials  working  for  the  Ministry,  and  supporting  organizational  reform 
initiatives.   IICA  is  also  helping  in  continuous  improvement  of  service 
delivery  in  diverse  areas  like  MCA21,  corporate  governance,  corporate 
social responsibility, investor education and protection, etc. The institute is 
promoting and encouraging innovation and entrepreneurship, particularly in 
small  and  medium  enterprise.   It  is  providing  quality  action  research, 
consultancy  and  information  services/support  to  all  its  stakeholders 
including  the  Government,  companies,  professionals,  Directors  of 
companies,  investors  etc.   IICA  is  helping  develop  and  maintain  a 
knowledge Management  system,  covering  all  aspects,  issues,  experiences 
relating to Indian and global corporate functioning/affairs, linked to internal 
and external  information with speed and in formats  designed for  ease of 
access, navigation and utilization.  The Institute will provide comprehensive 
coverage of all disciplines/subjects involved in, or impacting on, corporate 
functioning. The mandates for IICA mentioned above are not exhaustive.


